

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	BRAND
Group 1	AUTO AND LIGHT TRUCK			
1.	10 ea. P205/75R15, 4 Ply, SAWS #16812 Brand Name & Number	83.00 830.00	830.00	Firestone Destination #026495
2.	20 ea. P215/75R14, 4 Ply, SAWS #32099 Brand Name & Number	78.00 1,560.00	1,560.00	Hankook Optimo #1011002
3.	10 ea. P225/70R16, 4 Ply, SAWS# 16843 Brand Name & Number	89.00 890.00	890.00	Firestone Destination #147560
4.	10 ea. P235/70R15, 4 ply, SAWS# 1278 Brand Name & Number	83.00 830.00	830.00	Firestone Firehawk #118656
5.	10 ea. P235/70R16, 4 Ply, SAWS #1423 Brand Name & Number	96.00 960.00	960.00	Firestone Destination #054375
6.	10 ea. P235/75R15, XL Ply, SAWS #1105 Brand Name & Number	86.00 860.00	860.00	Bridgestone Insignia #026036
7.	20 ea. P235/75R16, 4 Ply, SAWS# 1308 Brand Name & Number	95.00 1,900.00	1,900.00	Firestone Destination #054358
8.	30 ea. P245/70R17, 4 Ply, SAWS #1130 Brand Name & Number	98.00 2,940.00	2,940.00	Firestone Destination #087389
9.	10 ea. P255/70R16, 4 Ply, SAWS #1129 Brand Name & Number	100.00 1,000.00	1,000.00	Firestone Destination #147033
10.	10 ea. P265/65R18, 4 Ply, SAWS #32098 Brand Name & Number	108.00 1,080.00	1,080.00	Firestone Destination #090177
11.	10 ea. P265/70R17, 4 Ply, SAWS #32239 Brand Name & Number	113.00 1,130.00	1,130.00	Firestone Destination #147067
12.	50 ea. LT225/70R19.5HWY, 10 Ply, SAWS #16755 Brand Name & Number	288.00 14,400.00	14,400.00	Firestone FS560 Plus #160716
13.	50 ea. LT225/70R19.5LUG, 10 Ply, SAWS #16782 Brand Name & Number	299.00 14,950.00	14,950.00	Firestone Transforce #186675
14.	50 ea. LT225/75R16, 8 Ply, SAWS #16801 Brand Name & Number	93.00 4,650.00	4,650.00	Firestone Transforce #189752

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

15.	10 ea. LT235/75R15, 6 Ply, SAWS #1262 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	91.00 910.00 Firestone Transforce #189837
16.	10 ea. LT235/75R17.5, 10 Ply, SAWS #36623 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	338.00 3,380.00 Bridgestone #158183
17.	10 ea. LT235/80R17, 10 Ply, SAWS #16783 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	108.00 1,080.00 Firestone #191282
18.	10 ea. LT235/85R16, 10 Ply, SAWS #1344 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	103.00 1,030.00 Firestone Transforce #189718
19.	20 ea. LT245/70R17, 10 Ply, SAWS #1599 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	106.00 2,120.00 Firestone Transforce 191316
20.	60 ea. LT245/75R16, 10 Ply, SAWS #16806 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	99.00 5,940.00 Firestone Transforce #189769
21.	32 ea. LT245/75R17, 10 Ply, SAWS #16841 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	109.00 3,488.00 Firestone Transforce #207483
22.	40 ea. LT265/70R17, 10 Ply, SAWS #32239 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	118.00 4,720.00 Firestone Transforce #200156
23.	30 ea. LT265/75R16, 10 Ply, SAWS #16808 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	110.00 3,300.00 Firestone Transforce #189786
24.	32 ea. LT275/65R18, 10 Ply, SAWS #16821 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	129.00 4,128.00 Firestone Transforce #207619
	TOTAL (GROUP 1)	TOTAL	78,076.00
Group 2	ALL TERRAIN AND MUD GRIP		
1.	10 ea. P235/75R15 A/T, 6 Ply, SAWS #1157 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	93.00 930.00 Firestone Transforce #189650
2.	20 ea. LT245/70R17 A/T, 10 Ply, SAWS #1271 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	107.00 2,140.00 Firestone Transforce #200173
3.	20 ea. LT245/70R17 MUD, 10 Ply, SAWS #1599 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	125.00 2,500.00 Firestone Destination #190279

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

4.	20 ea. LT245/75R16 MUD, 10 Ply, SAWS #1596 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 120.00 2,400.00 Firestone Destination #155543
5.	20 ea. LT245/75R17 MUD, 10 Ply, SAWS #16802 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 112.00 2,240.00 Firestone Destination #205222
6.	40 ea. 255/70R17 A/T SL Ply, SAWS #16839 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 113.00 4,520.00 Firestone Destination #054290
7.	40 ea. LT265/70R17 A/T, 10 Ply, SAWS #16807 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 121.00 4,840.00 Firestone Destination #200190
	TOTAL (GROUP 2)	TOTAL	19,570.00
Group 3	MEDIUM AND HEAVY DUTY		
1.	30 ea. 10R22.5 HWY, 12 Ply, SAWS #16762 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 329.00 9,870.00 Firestone #211274
2.	30 ea. 10R22.5LUG Open Shoulder, 12 Ply, SAWS #16763 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 351.00 10,530.00 Firestone #281034
3.	80 ea. 11R22.5 HWY, 16 Ply, SAWS #16770 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 394.00 31,520.00 Firestone #156558
4.	80 ea. 11R22.5 LUG OPEN SHOULDER, 16 ply, SAWS #16771 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 424.00 33,920.00 Firestone #211206
5.	80 ea. 12R22.5 HWY, 16 ply, SAWS #16778 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 480.00 38,400.00 Firestone #156523
6.	80 ea. 12R22.5 LUG OPEN SHOULDER, 16 ply, SAWS #16775 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 509.00 40,720.00 Firestone #151009
7.	10 ea. 275/80R22.5 HWY 16 Ply, SAWS #36624 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 408.00 4,080.00 Firestone #297062
8.	15 ea. 315/80R22.5, 24 Ply, SAWS #1261 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 490.00 7,350.00 Firestone #240623
9.	15 ea. 385/65R22.5, 30 Ply, SAWS #16785 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 610.00 9,150.00 Firestone #294586

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

10.	15 ea. 385/75R22.5, 20 Ply, SAWS #36625 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 610.00 9,150.00 Firestone #294586
11.	15 ea. 425/65R22.5, 20 Ply, SAWS #1287 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 682.00 10,230.00 Firestone #294594
12.	6 ea. 445/65R22.5, 20 Ply, SAWS #32102 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 790.00 4,740.00 Firestone #294608
TOTAL (GROUP 3)		TOTAL	209,660.00
Group 4	INDUSTRIAL LUG AND TRAILER		
1.	10 ea. 480-8, NHS 8 Ply, SAWS #36626 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 28.00 280.00 Deestone #7251
2.	10 ea. 4.80-12, NHS, SAWS #36627 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 44.00 440.00 Deestone #7266
3.	10 ea. 6.00 X 9, NHS 10 Ply, SAWS #32104 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 97.50 975.00 Deestone #6125
4.	10 ea. 6.50-10, NHS, SAWS #36635 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 105.00 1,050.00 Deestone #6130
5.	10 ea. 6.50 X 10-10 NHS, SAWS #36636 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 131.00 1,310.00 Deestone #554263
6.	10 ea. 7.00 - 12, NHS, SAWS #16790 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 155.00 1,550.00 Deestone #6135
7.	10 ea. 7.00 X 12-12, NHS, SAWS #1124 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 159.00 1,590.00 Carlisle #554212
8.	10 ea. 7.00 - 15, HWY, SAWS #16789 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 82.50 825.00 Supermax M686 #STB-6004A-SL
9.	10 ea. 8.55 15, HWY, SAWS #36628 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 61.00 610.00 Gladiator #1142002252
10.	150 ea. 11L - 16SL, NHS Rim Guard, SAWS #1598 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	 152.00 22,800.00 Armour 1414831163

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	BRAND
11.	10 ea. 11R - 24.5, NSH, SAWS #1366 Brand Name & Number		452.00 4,520.00	Firestone #281565
12.	12 ea. 12 - 16.5 Solid, SAWS #32116 Brand Name & Number		725.00 8,700.00	Solid Tire #165
13.	20 ea. 12 - 16.5, NHS Rim Guard, SAWS #16773 Brand Name & Number		173.00 3,460.00	Armour #1416922653
14.	10 ea. 18 X 8.50, NHS 4 Ply, SAWS #16827 Brand Name & Number		37.00 370.00	Deestone #7226
15.	50 ea. 19.5 - 24, NHS, SAWS #1327 Brand Name & Number		635.00 31,750.00	Armour #1417629244
16.	15 ea. 20.5 X 25 NHS 16 Ply, SAWS #16828 Brand Name & Number		1,075.00 16,125.00	Firestone #408492
17.	8 ea. 23.5R 25, NHS, SAWS #36629 Brand Name & Number		2,280.00 18,240.00	Bridgestone #422703
18.	10 ea. 26 X 8-12 NHS, SAWS #36637 Brand Name & Number		106.00 1,060.00	Carlisle #560480
19.	10 ea. 26 X 9-12 NHS, SAWS #36638 Brand Name & Number		107.00 1,070.00	Carlisle #560460
20.	10 ea. 26 X 10-12 NHS, SAWS #36639 Brand Name & Number		125.00 1,250.00	Carlisle #560442
21.	15 ea. 300 X 15-20 NHS, SAWS #32114 Brand Name & Number		640.00 9,600.00	Carlisle #54P2H3
22.	10 ea. ST175/80R13 HWY 8 Ply, SAWS #36640 Brand Name & Number		37.00 370.00	Gladiator #1142001831
23.	10 ea. ST205/75R14 HWY 8 Ply, SAWS #16812 Brand Name & Number		47.00 470.00	Gladiator #1142002041
24.	20 ea. ST205/75R15 HWY 8 Ply, SAWS #16813 Brand Name & Number		52.60 1,052.00	Gladiator #1142002052
25.	250 ea. ST215/75R17.5 HWY 16 Ply, SAWS #16383 Brand Name & Number		265.00 66,250.00	Bridgestone #264695

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

26.	10 ea. ST225/75R15 Hwy 8 Ply, SAWS #35997 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	61.00 610.00 Gladiator #1142002252
27.	10 ea. ST235/80R16 HWY 16 Ply, SAWS #35999 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	78.00 780.00 Gladiator #1142002863
28.	10 ea. ST235/85R16 HWY 10 Ply, SAWS #1344 Brand Name & Number	UNIT PRICE TOTAL BRAND	88.00 880.00 Gladiator #1142003864
	TOTAL (GROUP 4)	TOTAL	197,987.00
	BRIDGESTONE Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		20% All passenger, 20% All light truck, 0% All medium truck, 16% Small off the road bias, 25% Small off the road radial, 16% Large off the road bias, '18% Large off the road radia
	FIRESTONE Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		20% All Passanger, 20% PV41, PVS, GT Pursuit, '20% All light truck radial, 20%All medium truck radial, '16% Small off the road bias, 16% Medium and large OTR
	B F GOODRICH Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		
	KELLY-SPRINGFIELD Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		
	GOODYEAR Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		
	MICHELIN Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		
	UNIROYAL Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

	COOPER Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		
	CONTINENTAL Price List Catalog Number Discount Off Price List (%) Multiplier for Discount Effective Date of Price List		
Group 6	TIRES AND ACCESSORIES, REPAIR AND SERVICE SPECIFICATIONS		
	700 Service Calls inside Anderson Loop 1604, SAWS #27128 (all equipment other than backhoes and front-end loaders)		45.00 31,500.00
1.	500 Repairs (all equipment other than backhoes and frontend loaders) SAWS #31080		25.00 12,500.00
2.	600 ea. Valve stems (long) (all equipment other than backhoes and front-end loaders) (all requests regardless of type or size), SAWS #16844		4.00 2,400.00
3.	500 Service calls inside Anderson Loop 1604 (heavy equipment: backhoes and front-end loaders only) SAWS #27127		50.00 25,000.00
4.	15 Service calls outside Anderson Loop 1604 (all equipment) SAWS #27126		45.00 675.00
5.	400 Repairs (heavy equipment: backhoes and front-end loaders only), SAWS #27125		50.00 20,000.00
6.	300 Valve Stems (all heavy equipment regardless of type or size), SAWS #16836		7.50 2,250.00
7.	50 Overtime Service, SAWS #27124		50.00 2,500.00
8.	250 Fleet Check (6:45 @ 3930 E. Houston Street), SAWS #27123		55.00 13,750.00
9.	250 Fleet Check (6:45 @ 6003 Wurzbach Rd.), SAWS #1127		35.00 8,750.00
10.	250 Fleet Check (6:45 @ 13655 O'Connor Road), SAWS #16787		35.00 8,750.00
11.			

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

12.	250 Fleet Check (6:45 @ 515 Mission Road), SAWS #27123			55.00 13,750.00
13.	250 Additive alternate: (may or may not awarded) additional cost for fleet check (6:45 @ 3225 Valley Road DRWWTP), SAWS #1288			35.00 8,750.00
14.	250 Boot (any size) SAWS #16800			5.00 1,250.00
15.	100 Boot (any heavy equipment), SAWS #30959			7.00 700.00
16.	100 Dismount and mount re-tread tires (all equipment other than backhoes and front-end loads) SAWS #16833			0.01 1.00
17.	100 Dismount and mount re-tread tires (backhoes and front-end loaders only) SAWS #1260			0.01 1.00
18.	50 Tire pressure sensor (Ford) SAWS #36620			60.00 3,000.00
19.	50 Tire Pressure Sensor (GM), SAWS #36621			60.00 3,000.00
20.	50 Tire Pressure Sensor (Dodge) SAWS #36622			60.00 3,000.00
	TOTAL (GROUP 6)			161,527.00
Group 7	TIRES DISPOSAL FEES			
1.	250 Disposal Fee - Small Vehicles, SAWS #30155			2.50 625.00
4.	250 Disposal Fee- Large Vehicles, SAWS #30156			5.00 1,250.00
5.	250 Disposal Fee - OTR Vehicles, SAWS #30960			20.00 5,000.00
	TOTAL (GROUP 7)			6,875.00
				*
	TOTAL GROUPS 1-7			673,695.00

BID NOT TABULATED
 CONDITIONAL BID

NO BID

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for
 FOR: Tires & Tubes & Repair Services
 TIME & (January 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012)
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., November 22, 2011
 ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

Southern Tire Mart
 5051 Sharp Street
 Dallas, TX 75247

A to Z Tire & Battery, Inc.
 P.O. Box 9138
 Amarillo, TX 79105-9138

Beasley Tire Service
 P.O. Box 11556
 Houston, TX 77293

	EXTENSION 1		673,695.00		
	EXTENSION 2		673,695.00		
	EXTENSION 3		673,695.00		
	Terms		1% 10 days		
	Delivery Days		1-15 days		
	*LOW BIDDER				

1

BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

A to Z Tire & Battery
 AAA Treadmasters
 Beasley Tire Service
 F&F Tire Sealant Mfr.
 O'Malley's Tire Sales
 Quality Tire Sale and Service

Southern Tire Mart
 Specialty Tire & Service
 T&W Tire
 TCI Tire Centers
 Wingfoot Commercial Tire Sys

Demandstar
 SAWS Website